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UMPIRES’ MANAGER REPORT 
 

Tournament:  

Umpires’ Manager:  

Venue:  

Dates:  

 

PRE-TOURNAMENT Good (remarks, if any) Satisfactory (remarks, if any) Poor (remarks, if any) 

Information provided by HI (feedback 
reports for Umpires below 25 years 
age, from their earlier assignments) : 

 

  

Information provided by OC: 

 

 

  

Contact with TD: 

 

   

Contact with Umpires panel: 

 

   

Travel arrangements for UM: 

 

   

Travel arrangements for Umpires: 

 

   

Transport arrangements on arrival: 

 

   

Facilities for fitness testing (Beep Test): 

 

   

Provision of shirts: 

 

   

Comments: 
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TOURNAMENT ORGANISATION 
Good (remarks, if any) 

Satisfactory (remarks, if 
any) 

Poor (remarks, if 
any) 

Hotel:    

Transport during Tournament:    

Facilities for Umpires at Stadium:    

Facilities for UM at Stadium:    

IT and Video facilities:    

Medical facilities for Umpires:    

Local Umpires’ Liaison (if provided):    

Social events:    

Comments: 

 

 

 

 
 
 

TOURNAMENT ORGANISATION 
Good (remarks, if any) 

Satisfactory (remarks, if 
any) 

Poor (remarks, if 
any) 

Umpire Briefing Arrangements: 

 

   

Working relationship with TD: 

 

   

Daily review / agreement of Umpire 
Marks: 

 

   

Umpire Review Meeting(s) (focussing 
on Umpires below 25 years): 

 

   

Comments: 
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END OF TOURNAMENT 
Good (remarks, if any) 

Satisfactory (remarks, if 
any) 

Poor (remarks, if 
any) 

Preparation of feedback forms with TD 
(focussing on Umpires below 25 years 
age and relevant feedback given for 
improvement in further assignments): 

 

   

Agreement with TD about Umpire 
Marks: 

 

 

   

Umpire Tournament review 
arrangements (use of FIH Rules of 
Hockey Video Library  
http://www.dartfish.tv/fih for explaining 
any rule to the Umpire): 

 

   

Transport arrangements on departure: 

 

 

   

Comments: 

 

 

 

 

UMPIRING STANDARDS  

 

 

To include information which needs to 
be brought to the attention of the 
Umpiring, Technical and Competitions 
Committee on individual umpires 
(specially for ones below the age of 
25 years) and their performances, 
which are not detailed in the 
UPF/Marks Sheet forms, as well as any 
comments regarding the strength of the 
umpiring panel relative to the strength 
of the Tournament.  

Provide relevant and detailed feedback 
for Umpires below 25 years age and 
their understanding of a particular rule 
using the FIH Rules of Hockey Video 
Library. Areas to be focussed upon by 
the Umpires’ Manager for their next 
assignment. 

                                                            

 

http://www.dartfish.tv/fih
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TOURNAMENT OR PLAYING 
OBSERVATIONS 

 

To include any comments on rules, 
their interpretation or other points of 
interest (as appropriate) which need to 
be brought to the attention of the 
Umpiring, Technical and Competitions 
Committees, as well as any Medical or 
Equipment matters.   

 

 

 

CONCLUSIONS 

 

 

To include any comments and 
recommendations with regard to 
problems encountered before, during 
or after this Tournament, which would 
assist in their resolution at future 
events.   

 

 

 

 
UM Name: 
 

  
Date: 

 

 
Signature: 
 

  

 


